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Adobe Photoshop Lightroom is fast becoming the digital photographer’s tool of choice, with its killer
combination of versatile photo cataloging features and powerful image editing tools. Adobe Photoshop, its
older relative, is still around, though, and is still indispensable for the unique tools it offers, as well as its
wide range of uses. This book shows photographers how to use these two great products together to achieve
results they could not have produced working with one alone.

First, the book provides a quick overview of the cataloging functions of Lightroom -- useful for Photoshop
users who may have used a different photo organization tool (or none at all!). Then you’ll work through a
series of projects that focus on taking images from Lightroom into Photoshop to use tools not available in
Lightroom. Typical workflows include stitching images into a panorama, layering multiple exposures of a
scene to create a high dynamic range (HDR) image, fixing common photo problems (like blur caused by
camera shake), bringing out important details or adding creative effects with adjustment layers, or layering
images to create composites (including adding text or 3D objects), or doing precise photo retouching.

Classroom in a Book®, the best-selling series of hands-on software training workbooks, helps you learn the
features of Adobe software quickly and easily. Classroom in a Book offers what no other book or training
program does–an official training series from Adobe Systems Incorporated, developed with the support of
Adobe product experts.
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Kamp:

The book Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book Adobe
Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book? A number of you have a different
opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely proper. Right
now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each
other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers
Classroom in a Book has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for you. You
can search the enormous world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Jose Scott:

This Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book are generally reliable for you
who want to be described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this Adobe Lightroom and
Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book can be on the list of great books you must have is giving
you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that perhaps will shock your prior
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for
Photographers Classroom in a Book forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary,
giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in
reading.

Juan Crowe:

The particular book Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book has a lot of
knowledge on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research ahead of write this book. That book very easy to read you can get
the point easily after scanning this book.

Sheila Davis:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This book Adobe Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers
Classroom in a Book was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Adobe
Lightroom and Photoshop for Photographers Classroom in a Book has many kinds or genre. Start from kids
until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you are
the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun
and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that will.
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