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Completely revised new editions of the market-leading Chemistry textbooks for HL and SL, written for the
new 2014 Science IB Diploma curriculum. Now with an accompanying four-year student access to an
enhanced eText, containing simulations, animations, quizzes, worked solutions, videos and much more. The
enhanced eText is also available to buy separately and works on desktops and tablets - click here to watch a
video to learn more.

Follows the organizational structure of the new Chemistry guide, with a focus on the Essential Ideas,
Understanding, Applications & Skills for complete syllabus-matching.

Written by the highly experienced IB author team of Catrin Brown and Mike Ford, with additional e-features
by Richard Thornley and David Moore, you can be confident that you and your students have all the
resources you will need for the new Chemistry curriculum.

Features:

Nature of Science and ToK boxes throughout the text ensure an embedding of these core considerations●

and promote concept-based learning.
 
Applications of the subject through everyday examples are described in utilization boxes, as well as brief●

descriptions of related industries, to help highlight the relevance and context of what is being learned.
 
Differentiation is offered in the Challenge Yourself exercises and activities, along with guidance and●

support for laboratory work on the page and online.
 
Exam-style assessment opportunities are provided from real past papers, along with hints for success in the●

exams, and guidance on how to avoid common pitfalls.
 
Clear links are made to the Learner profile and the IB core values.●
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From reader reviews:

Jeff Puckett:

The book HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International
Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
utilize to make your capable more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting anxiety or
having big problem together with your subject. If you can make examining a book HIGHER LEVEL
CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma:
International E) to be your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you like start and read a e-book
HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate
Diploma: International E). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or
other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Peggy Ross:

The book HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International
Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. Why must we leave a very important thing like a book HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND
EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E)? Some of you
have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is
possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND
EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) has simple
shape however you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous world by
open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Walter Goodwin:

Here thing why this particular HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson
International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) are different and reliable to be yours. First of all
looking at a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as delightful as food
or not. HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International
Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
book out there but there is no guide that similar with HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION
BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E). It gives you thrill looking
at journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps
can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home
by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of HIGHER
LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma:
International E) in e-book can be your choice.



Daniel England:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book method, more simple and reachable. This specific HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION
BOOK + EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E) can give you a lot of
buddies because by you investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more
like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book
offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than other make you to
be great people. So , why hesitate? We should have HIGHER LEVEL CHEMISTRY 2ND EDITION BOOK
+ EBOOK (Pearson International Baccalaureate Diploma: International E).
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